Water Reclamation Facility Modifications
Bid Items
for
City of Hinesville
SE No. 2018-82.2

| Certify that this tabulation is a true and
representation of the bids received on
October 12, 2022

Southern Civil, LLC Lakeshore Engineering, LLC
Item Estimated
No. Quantity Units Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 1 LS Demolition $ 90,000.00 $ 175,000.00
2 1 LS Convert Digester to SBR #4 $ 1,225,108.00 $ 790,000.00
3 1 LS New Digester $ 1,705,000.00 $  1,450,000.00
4 1 LS Site Piping $  325,000.00 $ 465,000.00
6 1 LS Air Delivery System Modification $ 40,000.00 $ 50,000.00
7 1 LS Blower Building Modification $ 50,000.00 $ 75,000.00
8 1 LS Odor Control Replacement $ 225,000.00 $ 250,000.00
9 1 LS Grit System Replacement $  475,000.00 $ 400,000.00
10 1 LS SCADA Integration $  150,284.00 $ 125,000.00
11 1 LS Electrical (New) $  838,346.00 $ 1,850,000.00
Electrical (Repair) $ 20,000.00 $ -
12 1 EA Connect to Exist. Drainage Box $1,500.00 $ 1,500.00 $2,500.00 $ 2,500.00
13 20 LF 12" HDPE Drainage Pipe $ 200.00 $ 4,000.00 $ 100.00 $ 2,000.00
1 EA  Yard Inlet with grate $5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 3,000.00 $ 3,000.00
12 Erosion & Sediment Control
A. 350 LF SD1-NS Silt Fence N 7.00 $ 2,450.00 $ 4.00 $ 1,400.00
B. 2 EA  Construction Exit $2,500.00 $ 5,000.00 $2,500.00 $ 5,000.00
C. 1 LS Concrete Washout $ 750.00 $ 2,500.00
D. 1 LS Temp & Perm Grassing $ 7,500.00 $ 2,000.00
13 Sewer Repair
A. 200 LF CIPP Exist 10" DIP Sewer $ 150.00 $ 30,000.00 $ 250.00 $ 50,000.00
B. 20 VF  Manhole Lining $ 750.00 $ 15,000.00 $ 750.00 $ 15,000.00
14 Roadway & Multi-use Path
A 1 LS Roadway and Path Grading $ 8,000.00 $ 25,000.00
B. 540 SY  Geogrid Mat $ 20.00 $ 10,800.00 $ 5.00 $ 2,700.00
C. 100 SY 8" Concrete Sidewalk $ 150.00 $ 15,000.00 $ _75.00 $ 7,500.00
D. 640 S.Y  8"Granite Crusher Run Base S 30.00 $ 19,200.00 $ 25.00 $ 16,000.00
E 540 SY  2"12.5 mm Asphalt Topping $  45.00 $ 24,300.00 $  55.00 $ 29,700.00
15 1 LS Mobilization $  250,000.00 $ 300,000.00
Base Bid Total $ 5,542,238.00 $  6,094,300.00
Additional Bid Items
1 Replacement of wear liner in existing solids conveyors NO BID NO BID
2 Replacement of screw shaft in existing solids conveyor NO BID NO BID

TOTAL BID $ 5,542,238.00 S 6,094,300.00



